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PROJECT: Village of Viola-STP Upgrade  Contact:  Scott Kammerman, (309) 283-1583 
  Estimate: $1,450,000.00 
  Bid Bond:  5% 
Date of Letting: 11:00 AM, July 7, 2010  
  

Page 1 of 2 Deposit: $50.00 No Refunds 
      
 BIDDERS  Deposit Proposal  
 Name & Address Phone/Fax Received Submitted Addendum 
1. Leander Construction, Inc. 

24472 N. County Hwy 6 
Canton, IL 61520 

FAX 309-647-7401 
 

309-647-7400 
 

$50.00 
 
 

$1,689,000 #1,2,3 

2. Langman Construction, Inc.  
220-34th Avenue 
Rock Island, IL  61201 

FAX 786-2107 
 

786-8885 
$50.00 $1,939,900 #1,2,3 

3. Valley Construction Co.  
3610-78th Avenue West 
Rock Island, IL  61201 

FAX 787-7048 
 

787-0292 
$50.00 

 $1,993,300 #1,2,3 

4. Brandt Construction Co. 
700-4th Street West 
Milan, IL  61264 

FAX 787-6344 
 

787-4644 
 

$50.00 $2,180,000 #1,2,3 

5. Civil Constructors 
P.O. Box 868 
East Moline, IL  61244 

FAX 755-7576 
 

755-5535 
$50.00 NO BID #1,2,3 

6. G.A. Rich & Sons, Inc. 
300 East First Street 
P.O. Box 50 
Deer Creek, IL 61733 

FAX 309-447-6500 
 

309-447-6231 $50.00 NO BID #1,2,3 

7. General Constructors Inc.  
of the Quad Cities  
480-42nd Street 
Bettendorf, IA  52722 

FAX 359-4955 
 

359-4543 $50.00 NO BID #1,2,3 

8. Laverdiere Construction, Inc. 
4055 W. Jackson Street 
Macomb, IL  61455 

FAX 309-833-4993 
 

309-837-1258 
$50.00 NO BID #1,2,3 

9. Vanguard Contractors Inc. 
15 South Capitol Street 
Pekin, IL 61554-4100 

FAX 309-347-7799 
 

309-347-8000 
$50.00 NO BID #1,2,3 

10. Co Engineering, L.L.C. 
dba Piico 
1609 W. River Dr. 
Davenport, Iowa 52802 

FAX 563-388-7717 
 

563-388-7722 $50.00 Sub-Contr. #1,2,3 

11. Rock River Electric, Inc. 
101 Walnut Lane, Suite A 
P.O. Box 230 
Colona, IL  61241 

FAX 309-949-3020 
 

309-949-3000 $50.00 Sub-Contr. #1,2,3 
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12. Tri City Electric 

415 Perry Street 
Davenport, IA  52801 

FAX 322-1643 
 

322-7181 
$50.00 Sub-Contr. #1,2,3 

13. Verplaetse Excavating 
P.O. Box 438 
Viola, IL  61486 

FAX 309-596-2106 
 

309-596-2166 
$50.00 Sub-Contr. #1,2,3 

14. Gasvoda & Associates, Inc.  
1530 Huntington Drive 
Calumet City, IL  60409 
Attn:  John T. Greaney 

FAX 708-891-5786 
 

708-891-4400 $50.00 Supplier #1,2,3 

15. Lemna Technologies Inc. 
2445 Park Avenue 
Minneapolis, MN 55404 

FAX 612-253-2003 
 

612-253-2002 
$50.00 Supplier #1,2,3 

16. Utility Equipment Co.  
3739 State Street 
P.O. Box 1290 
Bettendorf, IA  52722 

FAX 355-7423 or 
355-0550 

 
355-5376 

$50.00 Supplier #1,2,3 

17. Zimmer & Francescon 
6200-65th Avenue 
Moline, IL  61265 

FAX 797-6053 
 

797-1117 
$50.00 Supplier #1,2,3 

18. Illowa Builders 
520-24th Street 
Rock Island, IL  61201 

FAX 794-3965 
 

788-9260 
N.A.  Plan Room #1,2,3 

19. Greater Peoria Contractors Assn. 
1811 West Altorfer Drive 
Peoria, IL  61615 

FAX 309-692-5790 
 

309-692-5710 
N.A. Plan Room #1,2,3 

20. McGraw Hill Const. Dodge 
3875 Elmore Avenue, Suite C 
Davenport, IA 52807 

FAX 355-1283 
 

355-1250 
N.A.  Plan Room #1,2,3 

21. Reed Construction Data 
30 Technology Parkway South 
Suite 500 
Norcross, GA  30092 

FAX 800-508-5370 
 

630-288-7995 N.A. Plan Room #1,2,3 

22.    
   

23.    
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